Vendor Name:

THE EARTHGRAINS CO.

Prompt payment discount percentage:

NA

Prompt payment discount terms (Net Days):

NA

Many districts are applying for the Federal USDA U.S. Healthy School certification which mandates the use of whole grain breads (not enriched). Whole grain breads must be stock items. Provide the
nutritional label for each item bid. Whole wheat items must list whole wheat as the first ingredient (not enriched).

# to make . Sugar Fat Type of
Item Description Brand #Qty per single Weight Bid Price Content | Content Grains
pack g per pack Per Per
serving . . and %
Serving | Serving
Bread, Sliced, potato bread (no flour content) NO BID
Bread, Sliced, round top, white COLONIAL22 SL 1(20 0z 0.9(SEE ATTACHED
Bread, Sliced, round top, white wheat SARA LEE |20 SL 212007 1.03|SEE ATTACHED
Bread, Sliced, round top, wheat SARA LEE |20 SL 1(20 0z 1.08|SEE ATTACHED
Bread, Sliced, round top, whole wheat SARA LEE |20 SL 1{20 0z 1.05|SEE ATTACHED
Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, white COLONIAL24 SL 2(20 0z 0.9(SEE ATTACHED
Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, white wheat NO BID |
Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, wheat COLONIAL22 SL 1(20 0z 1.18|SEE ATTACHED
Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, whole wheat NO BID |
Bread, Sliced, texas toast, white COLONIAL16 SL 1(20 0z 0.98|SEE ATTACHED
24 count Small buns sheet (Similar to White Castle size) COLONIAl24 CT 1|240z 1.99|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Sliced, 8 count pack COLONIALYS8 CT 1(12 0z 0.74|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Sliced, 1 dozen pack COLONIAl12 CT 1{23 0z 1.1|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Sliced, 30 count buns INST'L 30CT 1|56 0z 2.6|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Onion, Sliced, 8 count pack NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Onion, Sliced, 1 dozen pack NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Onion, Sliced, Tray Pack NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Potato, Sliced, 8 count pack SARA LEE |8 CT 1150z 1.35|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Potato, Sliced, 1 dozen pack NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Potato, Sliced, Tray Pack NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Wheat, Sliced, 8 count pack SARA LEE |8 CT 1{12 0z 0.9|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Wheat, Sliced, 1 dozen pack SARA LEE |12 CT 124 0z 1.35|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Wheat, Sliced, 30 count buns NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, 8 count pack SARA LEE |8 CT 1{23 0z 1.03|SEE ATTACHED
4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, 1 dozen pack NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, 30 count buns NO BID
4" Hamburger Buns, White made with Whole Grain, Sliced, 12 count buns SARA LEE |12 CT 124 0z 1.35|SEE ATTACHED
Hot Dog Buns, Sliced, 8 count pack INST'L 8CT 1{12 0z 0.74|SEE ATTACHED
Hot Dog Buns, Sliced, 1 dozen pack COLONIAl12 CT 1{18 0z 1.1|SEE ATTACHED




#to make . sugar Fat Type of
Item Description Brand #Qty per single Weight Bid Price Content | Content Grains
pack serving per pack Pe‘r Pe.r and %
Serving | Serving
Hot Dog Buns, Sliced, 24 count pack NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, Sliced, Tray of 5 dozen NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, Wheat, Sliced, 8 count pack SARA LEE |8 CT 1|12 0z 0.9|SEE ATTACHED
Hot Dog Buns, Wheat, Sliced, 1 dozen pack SARA LEE |12 CT 1210z 1.35|SEE ATTACHED
Hot Dog Buns, Wheat, Sliced, 24 count pack NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, Wheat, Sliced, Tray of 5 dozen NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, 8 count pack SARA LEE |8 CT 1|12 0z 0.9|SEE ATTACHED
Hot Dog Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, 1 dozen pack NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, 24 count pack NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, Whole Wheat, Sliced, Tray of 5 dozen NO BID
Hot Dog Buns, White made Whole Grain, Sliced, 1 dozen SARA LEE |12 CT 121 0z 1.35|SEE ATTACHED
Steak Bun (Hoagie style), 8 count EARTHGR/6 CT 1|15 0z 1.18|SEE ATTACHED
Steak Bun (Hoagie style), 24 count INST'L 24 CT 1|56 OZ 3.72|SEE ATTACHED
Steak Bun (Hoagie style), without seeds, 8 count SARA LEE |6 CT 1|16 0z 1.18|SEE ATTACHED
Steak Bun (Hoagie style), without seeds, 24 count NO BID
Steak Bun (Hoagie style), center split, 8 count SARA LEE [6 CT 1|16 0Z 1.18|SEE ATTACHED
Steak Bun (Hoagie style), center split, 24 count SARA LEE |6 CT 1|18 0z 1.55|SEE ATTACHED
Steak Bun, Wheat (Hoagie style), 8 count NO BID
Steak Bun, Wheat (Hoagie style), 24 count NO BID
Steak Bun, Whole Wheat (Hoagie style), 8 count NO BID
Steak Bun, Whole Wheat (Hoagie style), 24 count NO BID
Hoagie Roll, Whole Wheat, 6 count SARA LEE |6 CT 1{18 0z 1.65|SEE ATTACHED
5 %" sesame seed Slim Jim Bun NO BID
Sandwich Thins, Whole Wheat, Flat Buns, 8 count SARA LEE |8 CT 1{14 0z 1.9|SEE ATTACHED
Brown n Serve Rolls 12 pack COLONIAL12 CT 111 0z 0.95|SEE ATTACHED
Donuts - Individual Pkg Chocolate NO BID
Donuts - Individual Pkg Powdered NO BID
Garlic Bread Stick (no less than 1 oz) NO BID
Bread Stick (no less than 1 oz) NO BID
K & K Buns (Dinner Rolls) 1 dz package SARA LEE |12 CT 1|17 0z 1.02|SEE ATTACHED
Kaiser Roll SARA LEE [8 CT 1|21 0z 1.4|SEE ATTACHED
Stale Bread (also known as "day old" bread) NO BID |
Whole Wheat Bagels SARA LEE [6 CT 1|20 0z 1.03|SEE ATTACHED
Whole Wheat Dinner Rolls NO BID |
Deli Rolls, White made with Whole Grain, 6 count SARA LEE [6 CT 1|18 0Z 1.65|SEE ATTACHED

WHOLE GRAIN-RICH ITEMS

Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, Whole Grain-Rich

Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, White, Whole Grain-Rich

Bread, Sliced, sandwich loaf, White, Whole Grain-Rich (weight for 2 slices must be between 50-52 grams)




Item Description

Brand

#Qty per
pack

# to make

single
serving

Weight
per pack

Bid Price

Sugar
Content
Per
Serving

Fat
Content
Per
Serving

Type of
Grains
and %

24 count Small buns sheet (Similar to White Caslte size), Whole Grain-Rich

24 count Small round buns sheet (Similar to White Caslte size), Whole Wheat

4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, 8 count pack

4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, 1 dozen pack

SARA LEE

12CT

[y

24 0Z

1.35

SEE ATTACHED

4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, 30 count buns

4" Hamburger Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced (weight must be between 50-52 grams per serving)

Hot Dog Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, 8 count pack

Hot Dog Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, 1 dozen pack

SARA LEE

12CT

2107

1.35

SEE ATTACHED

Hot Dog Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, 24 count pack

Hot Dog Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, Tray of 5 dozen

Hot Dog Buns, Whole Grain-Rich, Sliced, (weight must be between 50-52 grams per serving)

Steak Bun (Hoagie style), Whole Grain-Rich, 8 count

Steak Bun (Hoagie style), Whole Grain-Rich, 24 count

Steak Bun (Hoagie style), without seeds, Whole Grain-Rich, 8 count

SARA LEE

6 CT

18 0Z

1.55

SEE ATTACHED

Steak Bun (Hoagie style), without seeds, Whole Grain-Rich, 24 count

Steak Bun (Hoagie style), center split, Whole Grain-Rich, 8 count

Steak Bun (Hoagie style), center split, Whole Grain-Rich, 24 count

Steak Bun, Whole Grain-Rich (Hoagie style), 8 count

Steak Bun, Whole Grain-Rich (Hoagie style), 24 count

Hoagie Roll, Whole Grain-Rich, 6 count

Hoagie Roll, Whole Wheat, center split, 6 count

Hoagie Roll, Whole Grain-Rich, center split, 6 count

Brown n Serve Rolls, Whole Wheat, 12 pack

Brown n Serve Rolls, Whole Grain-Rich, 12 pack

Whole Grain-Rich Bagels

Whole Grain-Rich Dinner Rolls

Deli Rolls,Whole Grain-Rich, 6 count

Gluten Free Products-Please list

Other Products-Please List

HOT DOG BUNS 12"

INST'L

6 CT

19 0Z

1.32

SEE ATTACHED




# to make Sugar Fat Type of
Item Description Brand #Qty per single Weight Bid Price Content | Content Grains
pack f per pack Per Per
serving ) ) and %
Serving | Serving

Whole Grain-Rich Criteria

Foods that qualify as whole grain-rich for the school meal programs are foods that contain
100-percent whole grain or contain a blend of whole-grain meal and/or flour and enriched
meal and/or flour of which at least 50-percent is whole grain. Whole grain-rich products
must contain at least 50-percent whole-grains and the remaining grain, if any, must be

enriched.




